
97
Wonder 
Woman 
Dawn of 
Justice
Sizes: S, M, L

$24.99

Includes: Dress, Tiara, 
Gauntlets, Armband and Belt

105
Supergirl

Sizes: S, M, L

$29.99

Includes: Dress w/Attached 
Cape, Boot Tops & Belt

113
Black 
Widow Civil 
War
Sizes: S, M, L

$24.99

Includes: Jumpsuit and Boot 
Covers

121
Batgirl

Sizes: S, M, L

$29.99

Includes: Dress with cape, 
glovelets, mask, belt and 
boot tops.

129
Elsa Classic 
or Deluxe
Classic Sizes: XS(3T-4T), 
S(4-6x), M(7-8)

$19.99
Deluxe Sizes: XS(3T-4T), 
S(4-6x), M(7-8)

$29.99
Deluxe Includes: Dress with 
character cameo and tiara. 
Classic Includes: Dress with 
character cameo

137
Anna 
Coronation 
Gown 
Classic & Dlx
Classic Sizes: XS(3T-4T), 
S(4-6x), M(7-8)

$19.99
Deluxe Sizes: XS(3T-4T), 
S(4-6x), M(7-8)

$29.99
Classic Includes: Dress with 
cameo character. Deluxe 
includes: Dress and 
headpiece.

98
Violet or 
Dash
Sizes: Small, Medium, Large

$24.99

Includes: Jumpsuit, mask, 
and gloves.

106
Catty Noir

Sizes: S, M, L

$29.99

Includes: Dress, Microphone 
and Boot Tops

114
Monster 
High 
Draculara
Sizes: Small, Medium, Large

$24.99

Includes: Shirt w/Attached 
Vest, & Skirt w/Attached 
Leggings

122
Robin

Sizes: S, M, L

$19.99

Includes: Eyemask, dress, 
belt, cape and glovelets.

130
Gryffindor 
Robe
Sizes: Small, Medium, Large

$24.99

Includes: Hoodes robe and 
clasp.

138
Elena Of 
Avalor
Sizes: Small, Medium, Large

$39.99

Includes: Dress with belt.

99
Trolls: 
Poppy or 
Branch
Sizes: XS, S, M, L

$24.99

Poppy Includes: Dress and 
headband. Branch includes: 
Jumpsuit & Wig.

107
Monster High 
Clawdeen 
Wolf
Sizes: S, M, L

$24.99

Includes: Jacket w/Attached 
Shirt, Skirt, Belt & Choker

115
Monster High 
Franky Stein

Sizes: Small, Medium, Large

$24.99

Includes: Dress w/Attached 
Sleeves & Tie, Belt & 
Leggings

123
Rey

Sizes: S, M, L

$19.99

Includes: Jumpsuit with 
attached scarves, belt, arm 
warmers, and cuff.

131
Pink Power 
Ranger
Sizes: Small, Medium, Large

$24.99

Includes: Jumpsuit and 
character mask.

139
Decendants 
2: Mal or 
Evie
Sizes: Small, Medium, Large

$39.99

Both Includes: Jacket, Top, 
Leggings, & Gloves

100
Heart Eyes 
for You
Sizes: Childs Standard

$19.99

Includes: Tunic.

108
Ride on 
Unicorn
Size: Child Standard

$34.99

Includes: Rider suit.

116
Dragon 
Ninja
Sizes: 8-10, 12-14

$19.99

Includes: Dress, Sleevelets, 
Footless Tights and 
Headband

124
Peacock 
Princess
Sizes: Medium, Large

$19.99

Includes: Dress, Wings, 
Glovelettes, and Footless 
Tights.

132
Rainbow 
Dash
Sizes: M(3T-4T), S(4-6), M(7-8)

$24.99

Includes: Tunic with 
detachable tail and wings, 
leggings and headband

140
Monarch 
Butterfly
Sizes: Toddler, Small, Medium, 
Large

$24.99

Includes: Dress, Wings, 
Headpiece & Leg Pieces

101
Lil Devil

Sizes: S, M, L

$9.99

Includes: Dress, Headband, 
Choker and Belt.

109
Doctor

Sizes: M, L

$9.99

Includes: Shirt, Cap, Mask, 
Pants, and Lanyard.

117
Gangster 
Gal
Sizes: Medium, Large, X-Large

$24.99

Includes: Jacket, pants, hat, 
mock shirt with attached tie.

125
Little Miss 
Mouse
Sizes: XS, SM, Med, LG, XL

$19.99

Includes: Dress, Headpiece 
& Gloves

133
Sassy 
Spots
Sizes: L, XL

$19.99

Includes: Hooded dress with 
attached tail, fingerless 
gloves, and footless tights.

141
Pumpkin 
Patch 
Witch
Sizes: Small, Medium, Large

$14.99

Includes: Dress and hat.

102
Rainbow 
Fairy
Sizes: Large, X-Large

$19.99

Includes: Dress, wings 
tights and glovelettes.

110
Cop Cutie

Sizes: Medium, Large, XLarge

$29.99

Includes: Dress, hat, belt, 
Glovelettes, handcuffs, and 
footless tights.

118
Cleopatra

Sizes: S, L

$24.99

Includes: Dress, Headdress, 
Collar, and Cape with cuffs.

126
Sailor Girl

Sizes: S, M, L

$24.99

Includes: Dress and Hat

134
Dark 
Countess
Sizes: Medium, Large

$19.99

Includes: Dress, Attached 
silver belt, and Choker.

142
Sparkle 
Star Witch
Sizes: 4-6, 8-10, 12-14

$19.99

Includes: Dress, Glovelets, 
Hat

103
Tinker Bell 
Classic
Sizes: XS(3T-4T), S(4-6x), 
M(7-8), L(10-12)

$29.99

Includes: Dress with 
detachable wings

111
Kansas 
Cutie
Sizes: Toddler, Small, Medium, 
Large

$19.99

Includes: Dress, Hair bows, 
and Socks.

119
Spanish 
Dancer
Sizes: Small, Medium

$14.99

Includes: Dress and hair clip.

127
Pink 
Flapper
Sizes: S, M, L

$14.99

Includes: Dress and 
Headband.

135
Graveyard 
Bride
Sizes: S, L

$24.99

Includes: Dress and 
headband.

143
Midnight 
Mischief
Sizes: S, M, L

$24.99

Includes: Dress, Glovelettes, 
and Stockings.

104
Feisty Fairy

Sizes: Large, X-Large

$29.99

Includes: Dress, wings, 
tiara, and glovelettes.

112
Miss Sock 
Hop
Sizes: Small, Medium, Large, 
X-Large

$29.99

Includes: Headband, Scarf 
and Dress with poodle skirt.

120
Sassy 
Samurai
Sizes: Medium, Large, XLarge

$24.99

Includes: Dress, Headscarf, 
Gloves, and Leg warmers.

128
Gypsy 
Magic
Sizes: M(8-10), L(12-14)

$29.99

Includes: Dress, Shawl and 
Scarf

136
Buccaneer 
Beauty
Sizes: Small, Medium, Large

$19.99

Includes: Dress, Headscarf, 
and Sash.

144
Crossbone 
Cutie
Sizes: Small, Medium

$24.99

Includes: Head scarf, Dress 
and Leg warmers.


